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Check the appropriate box below if the Form 8-K filing is intended to simultaneously satisfy the filing obligation of the registrant under any of the following provisions:
 
☐ Written communications pursuant to Rule 425 under the Securities Act (17 CFR 230.425)
  
☐ Soliciting material pursuant to Rule 14a-12 under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.14a-12)
  
☐ Pre-commencement communications pursuant to Rule 14d-2(b) under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.14d-2(b))
  
☐ Pre-commencement communications pursuant to Rule 13e-4(c) under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.13e-4(c))
 
Securities registered pursuant to Section 12(b) of the Act:

 
Title of each class  Trading Symbol(s)  Name of each exchange on which registered

Common Stock, $0.0001 Par Value  SONN  The Nasdaq Stock Market LLC
 

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is an emerging growth company as defined in Rule 405 of the Securities Act of 1933 (§230.405 of this chapter) or Rule 12b-2 of
the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (§240.12b-2 of this chapter).
 
Emerging growth company ☐
 
If an emerging growth company, indicate by check mark if the registrant has elected not to use the extended transition period for complying with any new or revised financial
accounting standards provided pursuant to Section 13(a) of the Exchange Act. ☐

 

 
 

 
 

Item 7.01. Regulation FD.
 
On October 31, 2022, Sonnet BioTherapeutics Holdings, Inc. (the “Company” or “Sonnet”) issued a press release announcing a collaboration agreement with Janssen Biotech,
Inc. (Janssen), one of the Janssen Pharmaceutical Companies of Johnson & Johnson, where in vitro and in vivo efficacy of SON-1010 (IL12-FHAB), SON-1210 (IL12-FHAB-
IL15) and SON-1410 (IL18-FHAB-IL12) will be evaluated in combination with certain Janssen proprietary cell therapy assets. A copy of the press release is attached hereto as
Exhibit 99.1.
 
The information in this Current Report on Form 8-K under Item 7.01, including the information contained in Exhibit 99.1, is being furnished to the Securities and Exchange
Commission, and shall not be deemed to be “filed” for the purposes of Section 18 of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended (the “Exchange Act”), or otherwise
subject to the liabilities of that section, and shall not be deemed to be incorporated by reference into any filing under the Securities Act of 1933, as amended, or the Exchange
Act, except as shall be expressly set forth by a specific reference in such filing.
 
Item 8.01 Other Events.
 
On October 31, 2022, the Company announced a collaboration agreement with Janssen Biotech, Inc. (Janssen), one of the Janssen Pharmaceutical Companies of Johnson &
Johnson, where in vitro and in vivo efficacy of SON-1010 (IL12-FHAB), SON-1210 (IL12-FHAB-IL15) and SON-1410 (IL18-FHAB-IL12) will be evaluated in combination
with certain Janssen proprietary cell therapy assets. The agreement was facilitated by Johnson & Johnson Innovation.
 
Sonnet shall supply the three referenced compounds for use in head-to-head studies. If successful and subject to provisions of the agreement, Sonnet could seek an expanded
collaboration.
 



Safe Harbor for Forward-Looking Statements
 
Certain statements contained in this communication may constitute forward-looking statements within the meaning of Section 27A of the Securities Act of 1933 and

Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934. All statements, other than statements of historical fact, are statements that could be deemed forward-looking statements,
including statements containing the words “predicts,” “plans,” “expects,” “anticipates,” “believes,” “goal,” “target,” “estimate,” “potential,” “may,” “might,” “could,” “see,”
“seek,” “forecast,” and similar words. Forward-looking statements are based on the Company’s current plans and expectations and involve risks and uncertainties which are, in
many instances, beyond the Company’s control, and which could cause actual results to differ materially from those included in or contemplated or implied by the forward-
looking statements. Such risks and uncertainties include, among others, the success of the agreement with Janssen and uncertainties and factors detailed in the Company’s
filings with the SEC, including in the Company’s Annual Report for the year ended September 30, 2021 on Form 10-K, which was filed with the SEC. As a result of such risks,
uncertainties and factors, the Company’s actual results may differ materially from any future results, performance or achievements discussed in or implied by the forward-
looking statements contained herein. The Company is providing the information in this communication as of this date and assumes no obligations to update the information
included in this communication or revise any forward-looking statements, whether as a result of new information, future events or otherwise.
 
Item 9.01. Financial Statements and Exhibits.
 
(d) Exhibits.
 
Exhibit No.  Exhibit
   
99.1  Press Release dated October 31, 2022
104  Cover Page Interactive Data File (embedded within the Inline XBRL document).

 
 

 
 

SIGNATURE
 

Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the registrant has duly caused this report to be signed on its behalf by the undersigned hereunto duly
authorized.
 
 Sonnet BioTherapeutics Holdings, Inc.
 a Delaware corporation
 (Registrant)
  
Date: October 31, 2022 By: /s/ Pankaj Mohan, Ph.D.
 Name: Pankaj Mohan, Ph.D.
 Title: Chief Executive Officer
 

 



 
Exhibit 99.1

 
Sonnet BioTherapeutics Announces an Agreement with Janssen for the Evaluation of Three Sonnet Product Candidates

 
● Sonnet’s three products, SON-1010, SON-1210 and SON-1410 to be evaluated in combination with Janssen’s cell therapy assets

   
● In vitro and in vivo evaluations to be conducted by Janssen in preclinical models

   
● Subject to successful results, Sonnet could seek an expanded collaboration

 
PRINCETON, NJ / ACCESSWIRE / October 31, 2022/ Sonnet BioTherapeutics Holdings, Inc. (NASDAQ:SONN), a clinical-stage company developing targeted
immunotherapeutic drugs, announced today a collaboration agreement with Janssen Biotech, Inc. (Janssen), one of the Janssen Pharmaceutical Companies of Johnson &
Johnson, where in vitro and in vivo efficacy of SON-1010 (IL12-FHAB), SON-1210 (IL12-FHAB-IL15) and SON-1410 (IL18-FHAB-IL12) will be evaluated in combination
with certain Janssen proprietary cell therapy assets. The agreement was facilitated by Johnson & Johnson Innovation.
 

Sonnet shall supply the three referenced compounds for use in head-to-head studies. If successful and subject to provisions of the agreement, Sonnet could seek an expanded
collaboration.
 
“This is Sonnet’s first head-to-head evaluation of three FHAB-based drug candidates, the results of which will be instructive for expanded oncology indications. A successful
evaluation could lead to a potential license agreement”, said Pankaj Mohan, Ph.D., Sonnet’s Founder and Chief Executive Officer.
 
About Sonnet BioTherapeutics Holdings, Inc.
 
Sonnet BioTherapeutics is an oncology-focused biotechnology company with a proprietary platform for innovating biologic drugs of single or bispecific action. Known as
FHAB (Fully Human Albumin Binding), the technology utilizes a fully human single chain antibody fragment (scFv) that binds to and “hitch-hikes” on human serum albumin
(HSA) for transport to target tissues. Sonnet’s FHAB was designed to specifically target tumor and lymphatic tissue, with an improved therapeutic window for optimizing the
safety and efficacy of immune modulating biologic drugs. FHAB is the foundation of a modular, plug-and-play construct for potentiating a range of large molecule therapeutic
classes, including cytokines, peptides, antibodies, and vaccines.
 
Forward-Looking Statements
 
This press release contains certain forward-looking statements within the meaning of Section 27A of the Securities Act of 1933 and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act
of 1934 and Private Securities Litigation Reform Act, as amended, including those relating to the Company’s product development, clinical and regulatory timelines, market
opportunity, competitive position, possible or assumed future results of operations, business strategies, potential growth opportunities and other statements that are predictive in
nature. These forward-looking statements are based on current expectations, estimates, forecasts and projections about the industry and markets in which we operate and
management’s current beliefs and assumptions.
 
These statements may be identified by the use of forward-looking expressions, including, but not limited to, “expect,” “anticipate,” “intend,” “plan,” “believe,” “estimate,”
“potential, “predict,” “project,” “should,” “would” and similar expressions and the negatives of those terms. These statements relate to future events or our financial
performance and involve known and unknown risks, uncertainties, and other factors which may cause actual results, performance or achievements to be materially different
from any future results, performance or achievements expressed or implied by the forward-looking statements. Such factors include those set forth in the Company’s filings with
the Securities and Exchange Commission. Prospective investors are cautioned not to place undue reliance on such forward-looking statements, which speak only as of the date
of this press release. The Company undertakes no obligation to publicly update any forward-looking statement, whether as a result of new information, future events or
otherwise.
 
Sonnet BioTherapeutics Investor Contact
 
Michael V. Morabito, Ph.D.
Solebury Strategic Communications
917-936-8430
mmorabito@soleburystrat.com
 
SOURCE: Sonnet BioTherapeutics, Inc.
 

 


